TOWN OF LEBANON

REQUEST FOR ACCESS TO PUBLIC RECORDS

1 request to review the following records in the Town of Lebanon:
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Hartford Equipment, Inc.
392 Lebanon Street
Sanford, ME 04073

207-324-0462 / fax: 207-324-0126

INVOICE #5824 01/13/16 Mieage In 70866
M 14
1P1F10BGAAO088776

LEBANON FIRE DEPT 88 FMC PREMFAB

15 UPPER GUINEA RD IMPERIAL T 942

Lebanon, ME 04027

Customer Repair Instructions

INSPECTION FAILED DUE TO EXHAUST WORK, BAD TIE ROD END RIGHT SIDE, STRUCTURE
SUPPORT OF TANK

-~ 1500 Group Total
| BRION 15.00

| INSPECTION MUNICIPLE VEHICLE *

| FAILED NEEDS EXHAUST WORK,LEFT SIDE
ITIE ORD BAD.NEEDS WORK ON TANK

| SUPPORT BEHIBD DRIVER SIDE

|[REAR TIRES , METAL ON BOTH INNER
|REAR FENDERS ARE RUSTED OFF

| FLOPPING IN AROUND.

_INSPECTIONMUNICIPLE

BRAKES  ADJUSTBRAKES 9500 Group Total
| BRION 95.00
| FOUND ALL BRAKES WAY OUT OF
| ADJUSTMENT DURING

| INSPECTION.ADJUSTED BRAKES

THANK YOU FOR CHOOSING US.
WE APPRECIATE YOUR BUSINESS.

harged
Charg Labor 110.00

SUBTOTAL 110.00

BALANCE 110.00



E STE RN Eastern Fire Apparatus, LLG Estimate

11 Industrial Way

P.O. Box 769
i Milton, NH 03851
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| Note: This estimate is not a contract or a bill. It is

Name/Address o -our best guess at the total price to complete the

' Lebanon Fire Department - work stated below, based upon our initial

1 15 Upper Guinea Road -inspection, but may be subject to change. If prices
' Lebanon, Maine 04027 ' | change or additional parts and labor are required,

| we will inform you prior to proceeding with the work.
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Estimate : Primer Pump Worn Out And Needs Replacement 1 1,250.00 1,250.00
! Estimate :Replace Discharge #1 Drain Assembly 1 125.00- 125.00
iEstimate | Replace Bulbs In Rear Tank Water Level Gauge | 11 35.00 35.00"

Estimate i Remove Rotten Pump Discharge Manifold And 5 1 1.850.00: 1,850.00

| Fabricate A New Custom Manifold. Reinstall And
- Check For Leaks.

Estimate Fabricate And Install New Rear Fenderwells For Body 1] 3,500.00 3,500.00
|

Pickup & Delivery J Free Pickup & Delivery Of Vehicle To And From Fire ' 0.00 0.00
! | Station

Please feel free to caII with questlons or comments Total $6,760.00



In all seriousness I wouldn't give you anything. You might find someone to give you $5.000 for
the engine and transmission if they are looking for a used drivetrain. There are so many things
wrong with it and its age along with rust that is out of control, nobody else will want to dump
money into it to get what is possible a few years out of it.

E STERN Jerry McKay Owner
Eastern Fire Apparatus, LLC

P.O. Box 769 Milton, NH 03851
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On Jan 19, 2016, at 7:09 AM. Dan Mechan <Chiefmeehan@lebanonfircems,org> wrote:

Any idea how much E1 would be worth if we sold it out right. One selectmen wants to know and
see figures to see if refurbishing it is worth it.



Lebanon Treasurer

From: Lebanon Treasurer <treasurer@metrocast.net>
Sent: Friday, March 18, 2016 3:10 PM

To: Skip Wood (woodsab@metrocast.net)
Subject: FW: FOAA Request

Dear Mr. Wood,

The information you requested regarding your right to know request is ready for pick up. The total cost is
$0.75. These documents may be picked up at the front desk anytime during our normal business hours. Thank you.

Jeanette Lemay - Treasurer
Town of Lebanon, ME

15 Upper Guinea Road

Lebanon, ME 04027

(207) 457-6082 Ext. 109

(207) 457-6067 FAX

From: Lebanon Treasurer [ mailto:treasurer@metrocast.net]
Sent: Friday, March 11, 2016 10:00 AM

To: Skip Wood (woodsab@metrocast.net)

Subject: FOAA Request

Dear Mr. Wood,
| am in receipt of your FOAA request and it has been approved. Our costs are as follows:

$0.25 per page for 8/12 x 11
$1.00 per page for 11 x 17
$15.00 an hour — first hour is free

At this in point in time we do not anticipate the cost to exceed $30.00. If we find that it will exceed $30.00 you will be
notified immediately upon that determination.

You will receive confirmation when those items are ready.

Jeanette Lemay - Treasurer
Town of Lebanon, ME

15 Upper Guinea Road

Lebanon, ME 04027

(207) 457-6082 Ext. 109

(207) 457-6067 FAX



